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PER CURIAM:  Affirmed pursuant to Rule 220(b), SCACR, and the following 
authorities: S. Glass & Plastics Co. v. Kemper, 399 S.C. 483, 490, 732 S.E.2d 205, 
208-09 (Ct. App. 2012) ("When reviewing the grant of a summary judgment 
motion, this court applies the same standard that governs the trial court under Rule 
56(c), SCRCP; summary judgment is proper when there is no genuine issue as to 
any material fact and the moving party is entitled to judgment as a matter of law."); 
Hancock v. Mid-S. Mgmt. Co., 381 S.C. 326, 330, 673 S.E.2d 801, 803 (2009) 
(holding when the underlying action is proved by a preponderance of the evidence, 
"the non-moving party is only required to submit a mere scintilla of evidence in 
order to withstand a motion for summary judgment"); S. Glass & Plastics Co., 399 
S.C. at 490, 732 S.E.2d at 209 ("In determining whether a genuine issue of fact 
exists, the evidence and all reasonable inferences drawn from it must be viewed in 
the light most favorable to the nonmoving party."); Nelson v. Piggly Wiggly Cent., 
Inc., 390 S.C. 382, 389, 701 S.E.2d 776, 779 (Ct. App. 2010) ("As Rule 56(e), 
SCRCP, states, a party may not rest upon the mere allegations or denials of his 
pleading[s]." (alteration in original) (internal quotation marks omitted)); Shupe v. 
Settle, 315 S.C. 510, 516-17, 445 S.E.2d 651, 655 (Ct. App. 1994) ("A conclusory 
statement as to the ultimate issue in a case is not sufficient to create a genuine issue 
of fact for purposes of resisting summary judgment."); Kase v. Ebert, 392 S.C. 57, 
61, 707 S.E.2d 456, 458 (Ct. App. 2011) ("To survive a summary judgment motion 
by the defendant in a lawsuit, . . . the plaintiff must offer some evidence that a 
genuine issue of material fact exists for each element of the claim at issue except 
for those elements that are either uncontested or agreed to by stipulation.").   

AFFIRMED.1 

WILLIAMS, KONDUROS, and LOCKEMY, JJ., concur. 

1 We decide this case without oral argument pursuant to Rule 215, SCACR. 


